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Specification
Resolution WVGA (854x480)

Maximum input resolution Full HD (1920x1080)

Light source RGB LED

Screen size (14”-84”) 28”@1m

Focus adjustment Manual

Aspect ratio 16 : 9

Screen offset 100 %

Contrast ratio 800 : 1

Throw ratio 1.6 : 1

USB USB Type-A

Bluetooth® BT4.0

Audio Ø3.5mm jack

Internal speaker 3W (Woofer)

Responsive OS iOS, Android, Windows OS

Product power input DC 5 V, 2 A

Size (WxDxH) 105 x 105 x 20mm

Weight 235g

Capacity 14.06Wh (3.7V, 3,800mAh)

Charging Time Max 4 hours

Usage Time Max 2 hours

Canon Singapore Pte Ltd



MOBILITY AND 
POWER

The compact size and in-built battery that 
lasts up to 120 minutes make the RAYO S1 
an excellent choice for presenting or playing 
movies on the go.

With brightness of 100 lumens and an 
optimum projection of up to 84-inches, 
the RAYO S1 delivers superior projection 
quality - far beyond what you’d expect 
from any mini projector.

Interact with the RAYO S1’s Android OS 
interface via touchpad. WiFi and bluetooth 
connectivity allows you to connect instantly 
and wirelessly to the Internet, smart devices 
and audio sources.

INTUITIVE 
SYSTEM

Important documents? Fun videos? With 
4GB capacity you can store it all. You can 
also use RAYO S1 to charge your devices 
with its 3800mAh powerbank feature.

STORAGE 
CAPABILITIES

Host conference calls with business 
associates or loved ones. The RAYO S1 
provides exceptional mono sound with 
woofer so you won’t have to lug around 
additional speakers.

IMPRESSIVE 
AUDIO

A head-turner with its sophisticated styling 
with titan silver highlights, the RAYO S1 is 
slim, portable and lightweight at just 235g.

ERGONOMIC 
DESIGN

Tripod not included with purchase of the RAYO S1


